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Type Systems
Type Binding is the process of 
assigning a type to a variable. A 
distinction is made between static and 
dynamic binding depending on whether 
the binding occurs at compile-time or at 
run-time respectively.

Binding vs. Checking
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Type Checking is the process that 
verifies whether the operands of an 
operator have compatible types. 
Depending on when the type checks 
occur, the term static type check or 
dynamic type check are used.

Coercion: is an implicit conversion of a 
variable from one type to another.

A Type Error is an error which occurs 
when an operation is performed on the 
wrong kind of data.

Type Strength refers to the 
effectiveness with which a type system 
prevents type errors. A strongly typed 
language prevents any operation on the 
wrong type of data. In weakly typed 
languages there are ways to escape 
this restriction: coercion.

Typing vs. Strength
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